NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

Regulations 1986, No.,43*

Regulations under the Financial Administration
and Audit Act

I, ERIC EUGENE JOHNSTON, the Administrator of the Northern
Territory of Australia, acting with the advice of the
Executive Council, hereby make the following Regulations
under the Financial Administration and Audit Act.

Dated this 25 day of O cldot, , 1986.
bt v IS HC T AT

[ E JORNSTON

Administrator

BW ‘His Honour s ComMand
. ) u

Q@QE?TT‘T%E”NUVMU* ﬁr*unu, itcfihe

AMENDMENTS OF THE TREASURY REGULATIONS

1. QUOTATIONS REQUIRED IN CERTAIN CIRCUMSTANCES
Regulation 9 of the Treasury Regulations is amended -

(a) by omitting from subregulation (3) "$1,000" and
substituting "$3,000"; and

(b) by omitting from subregulation (5) "$1,000" and
substituting "$3,000".

2. TENDERS REQUIRED IN CERTAIN CIRCUMSTANCES

Regulation 10(l1) of the Treasury Regulations 1is
amended by omitting "$10,000" and substituting "$25,000".

3. DETAILS OF CERTAIN CONTRACTS TO BE PUBLISHED

Regulation 14(1) of the Treasury Regulations 1is
amended by omitting "$2,000" and substituting "$3,000".

* Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette
on PR ARY. ., 1986.

Ly

G. L. DUFFIELD, Government Printer of the Northern Territory




