NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

Regulations 1986, No. 37*

Regulations under the Motor Accidents (Compensation) Act

I, KEVIN FREDRICK O'LEARY the Acting Administrator of the
Northern Territory of Australia, acting with the advice
of the Executive Council, hereby make the following
Regulations under the Motor Accidents (Compensation) Act.

Dated this I R day of J%a&»w6a~ , 1986.

/< C)%L?Z%¢:7
Acting Administrator

By His Honour's Command

Vinw o . 1\tf,‘37ridcnbﬂmﬁoﬂﬁf
Minister for Business, Technology
and Communications

AMENDMENTS OF THE MOTOR ACCIDENTS (COMPENSATION)
RATES OF BENEFITS REGULATIONS

1. CITATION

These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Accidents
(Compensation) Rates of Benefits Regulations 1986.

2. COMMENCEMENT

These Regulations shall come into operation on the
commencement of the Motor Accidents (Compensation)
Amendment Act 1986.
3. PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS

The Motor Accident (Compensation) Rates of Benefit

Regulations are referred to in these Regulations as the
Principal Regulations.

* Notified in the WNorthern Territory Government Gazette

on T , 1986.

G. L. DUFFIELD, Government Printer of the Northem Territory



Motor Accidents (Compensation) Rates of
Benefit Regulations
DEATH BENEFITS

Regulation 5 of the Principal Regulations is
repealed and the following is substituted:

"(1l) For the purposes of section 22(1) of the Act,
the prescribed amount is $55,000.

"(2) For the purposes of section 22(2) of the Act,
the prescribed amount is $40.".

5. REPEAL

Regulation 6 of the Principal Regulations is
repealed.

6. DEPENDENT PARENTS BENEFIT

Regulation 7 of the Principal Regulations is amended
by omitting "$25" and substituting "$15,000".

7. DEPENDENT CHILDREN'S BENEFIT

Regulation 8 of the Principal Regulations is amended
by omitting "$25" and substituting "$15,000".

8. FUNERAL BENEFITS

Regulation 9 of the Principal Regulations is amended
by omitting "$650" and substituting "$2,000".




