NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA
AMENDMENTS OF MINING REGULATIONS

TABLE OF PROVISIONS

Regulation

Rent for retained blocks

Rent for exploration retention licence
Rent for mineral lease

Rent for mineral claim

Repeal and substitution:

"14. RENT FOR EXTRACTIVE MINERAL PERMIT"

Time and manner of payment of rent
Method of marking out
Repeal and substitution:

"23. PRODUCTION RETURNS"

Registers
Schedule 1
Schedule 4
Further amendments

SCHEDULE




'r

NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

Regulations 1990, No. 48%*

Regulations under the Mining Act

I, JAMES HENRY MUIRHEAD, the Administrator of the Northern
Territory of Australia, acting with the advice of the
Executive Council, hereby make the following Regulations
under the Mining Act.

Dated 30 November 1990.

J.H. MUIRHEAD
Administrator

AMENDMENTS OF MINING REGULATIONS
3 A RENT FOR RETAINED BLOCKS

Regulation 7(1)(a) of the Mining Regulations is
amended by omitting "$5" and substituting "$10".

2. RENT FOR EXPLORATION RETENTION LICENCE
Regulation 8 of the Mining Regulations is amended -
(a) by omitting "$5" and substituting "$10"; and

(b) by omitting "lease" (wherever occurring) and
substituting "licence".

3. RENT FOR MINERAL LEASE

Regulation 11 of the Mining Regulations is amended by
omitting "$5" and substituting "$10".

4. RENT FOR MINERAL CLAIM

Regulation 12 of the Mining Regulations is amended by
omitting "$5" and substituting "$10".

* Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette
on 12 December 1990.




Mining Regulations

REPEAL AND SUBSTITUTION

Regulations 14 and 15 of the Mining Regulations are
repealed and the following substituted:

"14. RENT FOR EXTRACTIVE MINERAL PERMIT

"(1) The rent for an extractive mineral permit is
$50 per hectare or part of a hectare for each year or part
of a year in respect of the land the subject of the
permit.

"(2) For the purposes of section 115(2) of the Act,
the prescribed rent for a renewal period of an extractive
mineral permit is -

(a) $50 per hectare or part of a hectare in respect
of the land the subject of the permit, where the
renewal period is 12 months or less; or

(b) $100 per hectare or part of a hectare in respect
of the land the subject of the permit, where the
renewal period is longer than 12 months.".

6. TIME AND MANNER OF PAYMENT OF RENT

Regulation 17 of the Mining Regulations is amended by
omitting subregulation (2) and substituting the following:

"(2) The rent referred to in regulation 14(1) shall
be payable in the following manner:

(a) for the first year or part of a year of the
extractive mineral permit - with the application
lodged under section 107 of the Act; and

(b) for the remainder of the term of the extractive
mineral permit - not later than the anniversary
of the date on which the permit was granted.

"(3) The rent referred to in regulation 14(2) shall
be lodged with the application under section 115 of the
Act for the renewal of the extractive mineral permit.".

7S METHOD OF MARKING OUT

Regulation 19(1) of the Mining Regulations is
amended by omitting paragraphs (b), (c¢), (d) and (e) and
substituting the following:

"(b) an extractive mineral lease; or

(c) an extractive mineral permit,".




Mining Regulations

REPEAL AND SUBSTITUTION

Regulation 23 of the Mining Regulations is repealed
and the following substituted:

"23. PRODUCTION RETURNS

"The holder of a mining tenement shall furnish to a
mining registrar not later than 30 days after the last day
of June and December in each year, a production return in
a form approved by the Secretary in respect of all
minerals or extractive minerals mined on the tenement area
for the preceding period of 6 months.".

95 REGISTERS
Regulation 29 of the Mining Regulations is amended -

(a) by omitting from subregulation (1)(b) "Leases"
and substituting "Licences"; and

(b) by omitting from subregulation (2) paragraphs
(c), (d) and (e) and substituting the following:

"(c) the Register of Extractive Mineral Leases; and

(d) the Register of Extractive Mineral Permits.".

SCHEDULE 1
Schedule 1 to the Mining Regulations is amended -

(a) by omitting "$5.00" (third occurring) and
substituting "$10.00";

by omitting "$2.00" (wherever occurring) and
substituting "$10.00"; and

(c) by omitting "$5.00" (last occurring) and
substituting "$20.00".

11. SCHEDULE 4

Form 4 of Schedule 4 to the Mining Regulations is
amended -

(a) by omitting "EXPLORATION LICENCE" and
substituting "EXPLORATION LICENCE, EXPLORATION
RETENTION LICENCE"; and

omitting "claim an interest

(here set out full particulars)




Mining Regulations

and I forbid" and substituting the following:

Yelaim.an interest TN . in oo viscee

ooooooooooooooooooooo

(here set out particulars of the exploration licence,
exploration retention licence or mining tenement in
which the interest is claimed)

The interest claimed iS ...cceceeeee.

(here set out particulars of interest clalmed)

and I forbid".

12. FURTHER AMENDMENTS

The Mining Regulations are further amended‘'as set out
in the Schedule.

SCHEDULE
Regulation 12
AMENDMENTS
Provision Amendment
omit substitute
Regulations "lease" "licence"
9 and 10 (wherever occurring)

Regulation 28

Regulation
31¢1)

Schedule 1

"(other than an appli-
cation for an
exploration retention
lease) or tailings
licence"

"exploration licence"

"exploration licence
(wherever occurring)

"exploration or mining
tenement"

"exploration licence

or exploration retention

licence,"

"exploration licence,
exploration retention
licence,"

"exploration licence,
exploration retention
licence or mining
tenement"




