
NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

Regulations 1991, No. 43*

Regulations under the Motor Vehicles Act

I, JAMES HENRY MUIRHEAD, the Administrator of the Northern 
Territory of Australia, acting with the advice of the 
Executive Council, hereby make the following Regulations 
under the Motor Vehicles Act.

Dated 29 July 1991.

J.H. MUIRHEAD 
Administrator

AMENDMENTS OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES (HIRE CAR) 
LOAN SECURITY REGULATIONS

1. NOTIFICATION OF FINANCIAL ARRANGEMENTS AFFECTING 
LICENCE
Regulation 2(2)(a) of the Motor Vehicles (Hire Car) 

Loan Security Regulations is amended by omitting "$31.50" 
and substituting "$33.40".
2. REMOVAL OF ENDORSEMENT FROM LICENCE

Regulation 4(2)(a) of the Motor Vehicles (Hire Car) 
Loan Security Regulations is amended by omitting "$31.50" 
and substituting "$33.40".

* Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette
on 1 August 1991.
Government Printer of the Northern Territory


