
NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

Regulations 2001, No. 12*

Regulations under the Marine Act

I, JOHN CHRISTOPHER ANICTOMATIS, the Administrator of the Northern 
Territory of Australia, acting with the advice of the Executive Council, make the 
following regulations under the Marine Act.

Dated 5 March 2001.

J. C. ANICTOMATIS 
Administrator

By His Honour's Command

T. BALDWIN
Minister for Industries and Business 
acting for and on behalf of the
Minister for Transport and Infrastructure Development

* Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette on 2 April 2001.
Government Printer of the Northern Territory
Price S0.55 including 10% GST



AMENDMENTS OF MARINE (PLEASURE CRAFT) REGULATIONS

1. Minimum safety standards for pleasure craft for tender

Regulation 4 of the Marine (Pleasure Craft) Regulations is amended by 
omitting "$500" (wherever occurring) and substituting "50 penalty units".

2. Offence to operate pleasure craft or tender at sea recklessly, etc.

Regulation 5 of the Marine (Pleasure Craft) Regulations is amended by 
omitting "$500" and substituting "50 penalty units".

3. Powers of boating inspector

Regulation 7 of the Marine (Pleasure Craft) Regulations is amended by 
omitting from subregulation (4) "$500" and substituting "50 penalty units".

4. ' Hindering boating inspector

Regulation 8 of the Marine (Pleasure Craft) Regulations is amended by 
omitting "$500" and substituting "50 penalty units":

Marine (Pleasure Craft) Regulations

>

2


