
NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA 

AN ACT 

to amend the Northern 
Territory Tourist Commission Act 

B
E it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the Northern Territory of

Australia, with the assent as provided by the Northern Territory 
(Self-Government) Act 1978 of the Commonwealth, as follows: 

1. SHORT TITLE

This Act may be cited as the Northern Territory
Tourist Commission Amendment Act (No. 2) 1994. 

2. COMPOSITION OF COMMISSION

Section 6(1) of the Northern Territory Tourist 
Commission Act is amended 

(a) by omitting "11 members" and substituting "12
members";

(b) by omitting from paragraph (j) "industry; and"
and substituting "industry;"; and

(c) by inserting after paragraph (j) the following:

"(ja) one person appointed by the Minister being a
person who, in the opinion of the Minister,
possesses knowledge and experience of
Aboriginal needs and aspirations in the tourist
industry; and".

No. 64 of 1994

[Assented to 2 November 1994]



Northern Territory Tourist 
Commission Amendment (No. 2) 

3. MEETINGS OF COMMISSION

Section 15(2) (a) of the Northern Territory Tourist
Commission Act is amended by omitting "5 members" and 
substituting "6 members". 

2 


