
Section

10.

r.1.

12.

13.

1
2
,)

4

5
6
'7

o

9

NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALTA

WORK HEALTH AMENÐMENT ACT 1997

TABLE OF PROVISIONS

short tiEle
erincipal ecE
Duties of empLoyers
Duties of occupiers of workPlaces
Duties of self-employed Persons
Dut.ies of manuf acturers, &c.
Duties of owners
Interpretation
New section:

''50. ACCREDITED
PROVIDERS "

VOCATTONAL REHABILITATION

Employer Lo endeavour Lo find or assist
injured worker Èo find suitable emplol¡ment,
&c.

worker to undertake reasonable treatment. and
training, or assessmenE

Unreasonable delay in setLlenìent of
compensaLion

Regul-ati-ons

No. 27 of 1997





NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

ANI ACT

R g i, enacted by rhe Legislative Assembry of the Northern Territory ofn Australia, with rhe_ assenr as^ providéd Þy the -Norfhern Terrítory(Self-Government) Act lgiï of rhe Commonwealíh. as follows:

to amend LÏ:e Work HeaLth Act

1. SHORT TITLE

This Act may be cited as the Work HeaLth Arnendment
Act L997 -

2. PRTNCÍPAL ÀCT

The Work HeaJ-th Act is in this Àct referred to as
the Principal AcL.

3 DUTIES OF EMPLOYERS

Section 29 (1') of the Principal Act, is amended

(a) by omitting "$50,699" and substituting
"$125,000"; and

(b ) by omi tting
"$25,000',.

"$5,000" and substituting

No. 27 of 1997

[Assented to 2 June 1997]



rfork Heafth Amendment

4. ÐUTIES OF OCCUPIERS OF WORKPLACES

Section 30 of Lhe Prj.ncipal Act is amended -

(a) by omitting "ç50,000" and substitut.ing
'$125,000"; and

(b) by omitting "$5,000" and substiEut.ing
,'$25,000".

5. DUTTES OF SELF-EMPLOYED PERSONS

Section 304 of the erincipal Act is amended by
omitting "$5,000" and subs¿ituting "$25,000".

6. DUTÏES OF MANUFACTURERS, &C.

Section 308(3) of the Principal Acl is amended -

(a) by omitting "$50,000" and subst.ituting
',$125,000"; and

(b) by omitting "$5,000" and substituting
"$25'ooo"'

7. DUTIES OF OWNERS

Section 30C of the Principal Ace is amended -

(a) by omitting u$50,000" and substituting
"$125,000"; and

(b) by orniEting "95,000" and subst.ituting
"$25,000".

8. TNTERPRETA?TON

Section 49 (1) of the erincipal Act is amended by
inserting before the definition of "dependant,' the
followingr:

"'accredited vocational rehabilitation provider'
means a person, Àgency or body approved under
section 50 (1) ; ".

9. NEW SECTTON

The Principal Act is amended by insert.ing after
sect.ion 49 the following:

''50. ACCREDITED VOCATIONAL REHABILITATION PROVIDERS

" (1) The Authority ilây, in wrì.ting,
person, Agency or body as an accredited
rehabiLi tat.ion provider .

approve a
voCational

2



work HeaLth Amendment,

" (2) Approval under subseclion (1) is noE to be
giwen unless the Authority considers LhaL the person,
Agency or body is capable of providì-ng vocational
rehabilitation under this Act and the person, Agency or
body meets standards approved by Èhe Authority.

"(3) An approval under subsection (1) is subject t,o
Lhe conditions, if any, det.ermined by the AuthoriLy.

" (4 ) Àn injured worker who parLicipat.es in a
rehabiLitation program or workplace based reLurn to work
progra¡n under this Act is not. Iiable for any fees or
other cost in relation to t,he program if it. is provided
by a person who, or an Àgency or body ÈhaL, is not an
accredited vocational rehabilitaeion provider.

" (5) An accredited vocat.ional rehabilita¡ion
prowider must noE. contravene or fail to comply with a
condition to which the approval under subsection (1) is
subj ec t .

" (6) À person, Àgency or body must noL hold out
that. the person, Agency or body is an accredit,ed.
vocaÈiona1 rehabilit.ation provider unless the person,
Àgency or body is approved under subsection (1).

" ('7) A person, Àgency or body muse not provide
wocational rehabilitation services to an injured worker
under this Act unless lhe services are provided by an
accrediled vocational rehabilitation provider.

Penalty: $10,000.

Ðef aul-t penalty: 91,000

10. EMPLOYER TO ENDEÀVOUR TO FINO OR ASSTST INJURED
WORKER TO FTND SUITAALE EMPLOYMENT, &C

Section 75]\ of the principal Act j.s amended

(a) by omitting "An employer"
" (1) Ân employer" ,.

and subs t.i tuting

(b) by omitting from paraqiraph (a)
to do so, to find suitable
another employer"; and

"or, if unable
employmenE with

(c) by adding at. Èhe end the following:

" (2) An employer Iiable under t,his part
compensate an injured worker musL refer the worker Lo
alternative employer incent.ive scheme developed by
Authori t.y r¡there

to
an

the

3



(a) Èhe
wi t,h
and

Work HeaLth AmendnenE,

employer is unable to provide the worker
suitable employment under subsection (1);

and

(b) the worker is a long term incapacitated worker.

" ( 3 ) !,Ihere an injured worker' f or whose i.nj ury an
employer is 1iab1e under this ParE is employed by another
employer under an alternative employer incentive scheme
referred to in subsection (1), the first employer is
liable t'o compensate the injured worker for any
aggravat,ion, acceleration or exacerbation of the injury
thaE occurs within one year after the worker conìmences
employmene wiEh the other employer.

"(4) rn subsection (2), 'Long term incapacitat.ed
worker' means a worker who is being paid compensat.ion
under section 65. " .

11. WORKER TO Î'NDERTAKE REASONABLE
TRATNÏNG, OR ASSESSI.{ENT

TREATMENT ANÐ

Section 758 of the Principal ÀcL is amended by
inserting after subsection (1) the following:

" (1.A'¡ The employer of a worker who participates in
a rehabilitaLion program or workplace based reE,urn Eo
work program under subsection (1) musE, ensure that
proqram is provided by an accredited vocat.ional
rehabiliÈation provider. ,' .

T2. IINREASONABLE DELAY IN SETTLEMENT OF COMPENSATTON

Sect.ion 109 of the Principal AcE is amended

(a) by onit.ting from subsection (1) "it may
substituLing "it musL -"; and

(b) by onitting f rom subsect.ion (2) " the Court.
filâ]/ , I and subsÈituting "the CourL. must, ".

1-3. REGULATIONS

Section L87 (1) (s) of the erincipal Act is amended by
omitting "$2,000" and subst.itut.ing "g5,000".

4


	Blank Page



