
NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALTA

LANDS ACQUISITION A¡4ENDMENT ACT (NO. 2) ].998

Section

"32.
"33.
tt34 .

"35.

u36.

"37.u38.

T
z
J
4
5

TABLE OF PROVISIONS

Short title
Commencement
Principal Act
fnterpretation
Repeal and substitution:

''5A. APPL]CATTON IN RELATION TO NATIVE
T]TLEU

Repeal
fnterference
Repeal and substiEution:

''PART IV - PRE.ACQUTS]TION PROCEDURES

"Ðivision L - ProPosaT

6

7

I

NOTIFICATION OF PROPOSAL
FORM OF NOTTCE OF PROPOSAL
LODGEMENT OF OB.]ECTIONS
MODIFTCATION OR ABANDONMENT
PROPOSAI,

INVTTATION TO CONSUI,T
CONSULTATION AND MEÐTATION
APPLTCATION TO TRTBI'NAL"

Heading to Division 1 of Part V:

"Division 1- - Acquisition"

Repeal and substitubion:

"43. ACQUTSITTON GENERALLY
n44. ACQUISITION WTTHOUT

RECOMMENDATION

OF

"Division 2 - Consideration of Objections

9

l_0

OB.JECTTON OR

No. 50 of 1998



tL.
1)

l_3 .

]-4.
l_5.
1.6 .
1.1

l-8.
L9.
20.
21".

"45. COMPLIANCE WTTH RECOMMENDATIONS OF
TRTBUNAL IN CERTATN CTRCUMSTANCES

"454.JUDTCIAL REVIEW"

Effect of notice of acguisition
Service of notice of acquisition
Offers
Reference to Tribunal
Claims
Title documents
Entry into possession
Repeal
Compensation for acquired land
Prepa]¡ments
Offers of resettlement
Repeal and substitution:

"65. RATES OF INTEREST
"66. ASSESSMENT OF COMPENSATION''

23 New section:

'' 67A. COMPENSATION
OB,JECTION"

PAYABLE WTTHOUT

Notices
Counter offers
Reference to Tribunal
Documents to be transmitted bo Tribunal
Claims
offers
Reference to Tribunal
Documents to be transmi-tted to Tribuna]
Heading to Division 3 of Part VI]I:

"Division 3 - Proceedings before TribunaL"

Repeal
Payment into Tribunal
Instruments of determination
Repeal and substiÈution:

'' 84 . APPEALS ''

Notice of appeal
Powers of Supreme Court
Repeal
Rules of Court
Repeal
Repeal and substitution

''89. ACQUTS]TTON BY AGREEMENT UNDER THIS
ACT

''89A. OTHER ACQUISTTIONS"

24.
25.
26.
)'7
28.
?q
30.
3l-.
32.

33.
34.
35.
36.

37.
38.
39.
40.
4t.
42.

l- l_



AA

44.
45.
46.

48.
49.
50.
51_.

Service
Regris trar - General-
Repeal
InvesLment
New section:

''94A. DELEGATTON''

Regulations
Schedule 2
Transi tional arrangements
Regulations

t]-r_





NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA

AI\ACT

to amend the f,ands Acquisition Act

DE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the Northern Territory of
Llfius1¡¿lia, with the assent as provided by the Northern Terrítory
(Self-Government) Act 1978 of the Commonwealth, as follows:

1 SHORT TITLE

This Act lnay be cited as the Lands Acquisition
Amendment Act (No. 2) 1-998.

2. COMMENCEMENT

(1) Sections 3 to 7 (inclusive) and sections lL to
50 (inclusive) come into operation on the date fÍxed by
the Admínistrat.or by notice in the Gazette.

(2) Sections 8, 9, 1-0 and 51, to the extent those
sections apply in relation to the acquisition of 1and. in
relation to which there are no native title rights and
interests, come j-nto operation on the date fixed by the
Administrator by notice in the Gazette.

(3) Sectj-ons 8, 9, L0 and 51, to the extent those
sections apply in relation to the acguisition of land to
which Subdivision M of Division 3 of Part 2 of the Native
TitLe Aet 1,993 of the Conunonwealth applies (which
includes acts to which section 26ít (iii) (A) or (B) ,

No. 50 of 1998

[Assented 28 August 1998]



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

26 Q) (f) or 26 ß) of
operation on the date
notice in the Gazette.

applies), come into
the Admínistrator bY

that Act
fixed by

(4) Sections 8, 9, L0 and 5!, to the extent those
sections appfy in relation to the acquisition of l-and to
which section 43A of the Native Tit.Je Act 1993 of the
Commonweafth applies, come into operation on the date
fixed by the Administrator by notice in the Gazette.

3. PRTNCIPAL ACT

The f,ands Acquisition Act is in this Act referred to
as the Principal Act.

4. TNTERPRETATTON

Section 4 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting from the definition of "affected

tr)ersonrr in subsection (1) "or 33 (2) " ¡

(b) by omitting from subsection (1) the definition
of "Chairman" and subst,ituting the following:

"'approved form' means a form approved by the
Minister for the purposes of the provision in
which the exPression occurs;rr;

(c) by omitting from subsection (1) the definitions
Of "date Of acquiSitiOn", "Depuby Chairman" and
"Deputy Registrar" and substiÈuting the
following:

"'date of acquisition', in relation to land, means -
(a) in the case of tand acquired or Eo be

acquired by agreement under this Act - the
dabe agreed between the parties; and

(b) in any other case - the date on which a
notice of acquisition of the land is
published in the Gazette¡

'indigenous land use agreementt has the meaning
given in section 253 of the Native Title Act;";

(d) by omitting from the definition of "inlerest"
in subsection (1) "within the meaning of the
Native TitLe Act 1-993 of the Conrnonwealth";

(e) by omitting from subsection (L) the definition
of ttmembertt;

2



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

(f ) by inserbing af ter the def inition of 'tmortgagle"
in subsection (1) the followinq:

"Inat.ive title' and 'native title rights and
interests' have bhe meaning qiven in section
223 of the Native Title Act;

ve fitle Act' means the Native TitLe Act J-993
of the Cormnonwealth;

riNa

'native litLe holder'has the meaning given
section 224 of the Native Title Act; " i

(s) by omitting from the definition of "notice
acquisition" in subsection (1) "section 43"
substituting "section 43 (l-) (b) ";

(h) by omitting from the definition of "notice
proposal" in subsection (1) "section 34"
substitubing "section 33" ;

r_n

of
and

of
and

(j ) by omitting from subsection (1) the definition
of "pre-acquisiÈion hearing" and substituting
the following:

"'owner', in relation to l-and, includes a naEive
title holder in relation to the l-and; "; and

(k) by omitting from subsection (1) the definitions
of "Registrartt, ttrulest' and ttTribunaltt and
substituting the following:

'regisbered native title claimant' has the meaning
given in secbion 253 of the Native Title Act;

'registered native tit,le rights and inberests' has
the meaning given in section 30 (3) of the
Native Title Act;

" 'registered native title bodY
meaning given in section
Title Act;

'representative Aboriginal/Torres
body' has bhe meaning given
the Native Title Act;

corporate' has the
253 of the Native

Strait Islander
in secbion 253 of

Tribunal
Tribunaf

'Tribunal' means the Lands and Mining
established by the Lands and Mining
Act.t' .

5. REPEAI, AND SUBSTITUTION

Section 5A of the Principal Act is repealed and the
following substituted:

3



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

''54. APPLICATION TN RE],ATION TO NATIVE TIîLE

"This Act applies in rel-ation to an acquisition of
an interest in land that comprises native title rights
and interests -

(a) that is an act to which Subdivision M of
Division 3 of Part 2 of the Native Title Act
applies (which includes acts to which section
26 Õ-) (iii) (A) or (B) , 26 (2) G) or 26 (3) of that
Act applies); or

(b) that -
(i) is an act to which subdivision

Division 3 of Part 2 of the Native
Act applies; and

( ii)

Pof
TitLe

rel-ates, to any extent, bo an area of l-and
that is an afternative provision area
within the meaning of section 43A(2) of
the Native Title Act.".

Part II of Ehe Principal Act is repealed

7. TNTERFERENCE

6. REPEAL

Section 3L of the PrinciPal Act
omitt.ing "$500" and substitubing "$2,500
for 6 months".

is amended by
or imprisonmenÈ

8. REPEAL AND SUBSTITUTTON

Part Iv of bhe Principal Act is repealed and the
f ollowing substituted :

''PART TV _ PRE-ACQUTSITTON PROCEDURES

"Division 1 - ProPosaT

"32. NOTTFTCATTON OF PROPOSAL

" (1) The Minister must not acquire l-and under this
Ac¿ unless -

(a) the acquisition is by agreement -
(i) in the case of the acquisition of a native

title right or interest only with the
native title holder or in accordance with
an indigenous land use aqreenent; or

Â



Lands Acquisition Amendment (Wo. 2)

(ii) in any other case - with the owner of the
land; or

(b) the Minister has -
(i) caused a search to be made of the Register

maintained by the Registrar-General_ under
the ReaJ Property Act and of the Register
of Native Titl-e Claims, the NationaL
Native Title Register and the Register of
Indigenous Land Use Agreements maintained
under the Native Title Acb;

(ii) caused to be served a notice of proposal
on each person ascert.ained as a result of
that search or otherwise as having or
claiming to have in the land an interest
that wil-L be divested, modified or
affected by the acquisition of the land,
incl-udinq -
(A) the registered natj-ve

(if any) in relation
land; and

title claimants
to any of the

(B) the registered native title
corporate (if any) in relation
of the land;

bodies
to any

(iii)

(iv)

(v)

caused a copy of the notice to be served
on the representative Aboriginal/Torres
Strait Islander body or bodies in relation
to the land;

if the land is registered on a register
referred to in subparagraph (i) - caused a
copy of the notice to be lodged with the
Registrar-General or the Native Title
Registrar, as the case may be;

caused a notice of proposal in the
approved form to be served on the other
persons (who may be or include a person
lodging an objection under section 34 (1) )

the Minister is satisfied have or has in
the l-and an interest that will be
divested, modified or affected by the
acquisition and on the other persons the
MinisLer thinks necessary; and

caused a notice in the approved form to be
published in a newspaper circulating in
the area in which the land is situated.

5

(vi)



I'ands Acquisition Amendment (No, 2)

" (2) A notj-ce of proposal under subsection (1) (b)
may relate to the acquisition of 2 or more areas of land
or 2 or more interests in the sarne area of land.

" (3) The serving of a notice of proposal under
subsection (1) (b) does not constitute -

(a) an offer or binding agreement to acquire the
land the subject of the notice; or

(b) a recognition by the Territory that the person
on whom it is served has an interest in the
land proposed to be acquired.

''33. FORM OF NOTICE OF PROPOSAL

" (1) A notice of proposal is to be in the approved
form and contain -

(a) a description of the land proposed to be
acquired;

(b) details of the manner in which it. is proposed
that the l-and, if acquired, will be deal-t with;

(c) an invitation for all persons on whom the
notice is served to negoLiate with the Minister
an amount of compensaEion for the acquisition
(after all objections lodged in accordance with
section 34 have been dea]t with under this
Part) of their interests by agreement under the
Act and advising those persons that in the
absence of agreement the land wilL be
compulsoril-y acquired; and

(d) a statement to the effect -
(i) that any person on whom the notice is

served may, wiEhin 2 months after service
of the notice, lodge with the Minister in
the approved form an objection to the
acquisition; and

(ii) that, if the person is a registered native
title claimant or regístered native title
body corporate in relation to any of the
land, the objection may include an
objection to the acquísilion so far as it
affects their registered native title
rights and interests.

" (2) The Minister must cause to be served on each
person served with a notÍce of proposal a statement in
the approved form sununarising the rights of such persons
under this Act.

6



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

"34. LODGEMENT OF OBJECTIONS

" (1) A person who has or claims to have an interest
in land Lhe subject of a proposal ñây, within the
objection period or such further period as the Minister
in writing allows, lodge with the Minister an objection
to the acquisition.

" (2) For the purposes of subsection (1) ,

objection of a registered native titLe claimant
registered native title body corporate in relation to
of the land proposed to be acquired may include

the
or

any
an

objection to the acquisition so far as it affects their
registered native title rights and interests.

" (3) An objection -
(a) is to be in the approved form;

(b) if it includes an objection to the acquisition
so far as it affects registered native title
rights and interests - is to state the manner
in which it is said that the doing of the acb
would affect bhose registered native title
rights and interests; and

(c) is to be accompanied by ehe prescribed fee.

" (4) Subject to section 894, compensation is
payable to a person whose interest in land is acquired
under this Part whether or not the person lodged an
objection to the acquisition under section (1) .

" (5) fn subsection (1), 'objection period', in
relation to a person claiming to have an interest in land
the subject of a proposal, means -

(a) if the person is served
pursuance of sect.ion 32 (l-)
service of the notice; or

(b)

with a notice in
- 2 months after the

in any other case
of the notice
32(]-) (b) (vi) .

- 40 days
referred

publication
in section

after
to

U35. MOÐTFTCATION OR ABA}üDONMENT OF PROPOSAL

" (1) The Minister may, at any time before the date
of acquj-sition, modify or abandon a proposal.

" (2) The Minister must cause notice of any
modification or abandonment of a proposal to be lodged
with -

(a) each affected person;

7



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No, 2)

(b) each person who has lodged an objection under
section 34 (l-) ; and

(c) if a copy of the notice of proposal was lodged
with the RegisErar-Generaf or the Native Title
Registrar under section 32 (1,) (b) (iv) the
Registrar-General or the Native Title
Registrar, as the case may be.

" (3) The abandonment of a proposal under this
section does not prevent the Minister from entering into
negotiations to acquire the land the subject of the
proposal by agreement under this Act or otherwise or
prevent the acquisition of that land by such agreement.

"Division 2 - Consideration of Objections

''36. INV]TATTON TO CONSULT

"Wj-thin one month after receiving an objection
accordance with section 34, the Minister must invite
person who lodged the objection to consul-t with
Minister in accordance wiEh section 37.

l_n
the
the

"37. CONSULTATION AND MEDTATTON

" (1) The Minister must consulb with a person who
lodged an objection in accordance with section 34 about
the acquisition.

" (2) Where under subsection (1) the Minister
consults with any registered native title claimant or
registered native title body corporate who objects to the
acquisition, the consultation i.s to include consultat.ion
with the claj-mant. or body about ways of minimising the
impact of the acquisition on registered native title
rights and interesbs in relation to the l-and, including
(if section 24MD(68) (e) or 434(4) (d) of bhe Native Title
Act applies ín relation to the acquisition and it is
relevant to do so) about any access to that land or the
way in which anything authorised by the acquisition might
be done.

" (3) For the purposes of subsection (1), the
MinisLer is to be taken to have consulted with a person
if the Minister schedules and attends at least 2 meetinqs
(the scheduled date of the second meeting being at least
t4 days after the scheduled date of the first meeting)
for the purpose of consulting the person about the
acquis ition.

"(4) Subject to section 38, at any time after the
second scheduled meeti.ng referred to in subsection (3),
the Minister and the person objecting bo the acquisition

8



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

may agree to refer the matter to mediation and the matter
is to be taken to have been referred accordingly.

" (5) For the purposes of subsection (4)

(a) the parties may agree on the appoinLment of a
mediator; or

(b) if no agreement is reached - either party may
apply to the Tribunal for the appointment of a
mediator under section 36 of the Lands and
Mining TribunaL Act.

''38. APPLICATION TO TRIBUNAL

"At any time after -
(a) the second scheduled

section 37(3); or
meeting referred to in

(b) the expiry of one month from the date on which
a matt.er was ref erred to med.iation under
section 37 (4) ,

either the Minister or the person objecting to
acquisition may apply to the Tribunal to have
objection to the acquisition heard..".

the
the

9. HEADTNG TO DTVTSION ]- OF PART V

The heading to Division 1 of Part V of the Principal
Act is omitted and bhe followíng substituted:

"Division 1- - Acquisition".

1-0. REPEAL ANÐ SUBSTTTUTION

Sections 43, 44, and 45 of the Principal Act are
repealed and the following substituted:

"43. ACQUTSTTION GENERALLY

" (1) Subject to this Act, the Minister may acquire
land under this AcE for any purpose whatsoever -

(a) by causing an instrument of transfer or other
doctunene evincS-ng title to the land in the
Terrj-tory to be registered under the ReaJ-
Property Act by the Registrar-Generaf; or

(b) by compulsory acquisibion by causing a notice
declaring the land to be acquired to be
published in the Gazette.

9



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

" ( 2 ) lrlhere an application has been made under
section 38 to have an objection to the acquisition heard
by the Tribunal, subject to sections 44 and 45, the
Minister must not acquire land the subj ect of the
proposal until he or she has received and considered the
recommendation of the Tribunal.

"44. ACQUISITION WTTHOUT OB.fECTION OR RECOMMENDATION

"(1) Despite sections 34, 36 and 37, if subsection
(2) or (3) applies, the Minister may acquire land under
this Pivision -

(a) before the period for lodging an objection to
the acguisition under section 34 has expired;

(b) where an objection to the acquisition has been
lodged in accordance with section 34 - without
consid.ering the objecEion or consultinq with
the person who lodged the objection; or

(c) where an application to have an objection to
the acquisition heard by the Tribunal has been
made without the Tribunal hearing the
objection or making a recomrnendation about the
objection and without the Minister receiving or
consideríng the reconunendation of the Tribunal.

" (2) The Minist.er may acquire an interest in land
in accordance with subsection (1) if -

(a) the acquisition does not affect native title
rights and interests; and

(b) the interest to be .acquired is an interesb
referred to in section 47.

" (3) The Minister may acquire land in accordance
with subsection (1) if -

(a) the acquisition -
(i) does not affect native title rights and

interestsr or

(ii )

(b) the Minister certifies that,

(i) the urgency of the case;

is an act to which
26Í) (c) (iii) (A) or (B) of
Title Act applies, other than
which section 24MD(68) (a) of
applies; and

section
the Native
an act fo
that Act

having regard to -
or

L0



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

(ii) any other exceptional circumst.ances,

it is not practicable to delay the acquisition
until after the Tribunal has made a
reconunendation.

" (4) On being served with a copy of a certificate
under subsection (3), the Tribunal must terminate any
proceedings before the Tribunal relating to the
acquisition to which the certificate applies.

" (5) Where the Minister acquires land under this
Division (other than by agreement) in the circumstances
described in subsection (1), the Minister must tabLe in
the Legislative Assembly, within 3 sitting days of the
Assembly aft.er the publication of the notice of
acquisition in the Gazette, a statement of the reasons
for the acquisit.ion.

''45. COMPLTAITCE WITH RECOMMENDATTONS OF TRTBUNAL IN
CERTAIN CIRCUMSTANCES

" (1) Where the Tribunal makes a recorrìfnend.at.ion -
(a) uphol-ding an objection to the acquisition of

land so far as it affects registered nat.ive
title rights and interests; or

(b) that contains conditions about the acguisition
of land that relate to registered native titLe
rights and interests,

the Minister is to comply with the recommendation
unless Èhe Minisber -

(c) has consuLted with the Minister responsible for
indigenous affairs (being the Minister to whom
responsibility for aboriginal developmenb is
allotted under an Administrative Arrangements
Order;

(d) has taken that consultation into account; and

(e) is satisfied that it is in the interests of the
Territory not to comply with the
recommend.at ion.

" (2) Where the Minister is satisfied under
subsection (1) (e) thaL it is in the interest.s of the
Territory not t.o comply with the recommendation of the
TribunaL, the Minister tnay -

(a) reject the reconrnendation; or

Lt



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No, 2)

(b) accept the recommendation and reject,
substitute his or her own conditions
of the conditions contained
reconnnendation,

Section 46 of the Principal Act is
omitting from subsection (1) (b) t'sha11 be
modified" and substituting "Ís divested,
affected" -

vary, or
for, any
in the

and may acquire bhe land accordinqly.

"(3) Tn subsection (1), 'in the interests of the
Territory' includes -

(a) for the social or economic benefit of
Territory (including of Aboriginal peoples
Torres Strait Isl-anders); and

Lhe
and

(b) in the interests of bhe
locality in the Territory.

rel-evant region or

''45A. .fUDTCTAL REVIEW

" (1) A person aggrieved by a decision of the
Minister to acquire land under this Division (other than
a decision to acquíre land under section 44) may apply to
the Supreme Court for judicial review of the decision.

" (2) On receipt of an application under subsection
(1), the Supreme Court may review the Minister's decision
on questions of law on1y.

" (3)
person -

In this section'person aggrieved'means a

(a) who, inrnediately before the date of
acquisition, had an interest in the acquired
land that was divested, modified or affected by
the acquisition, including a registered native
title claimant or registered native title body
corporate whose registered native title rights
and interests l^Iere affected by the acquisition;
and

(b) who lodged an objection to the acquisition
under section 34. ".

11. EFFECT OF NOTICE OF ACQUISITION

amended
dives ted
modified

by
or
or

1-2. SERVICE OF NOTICE OF ÀCOUISITION

Section 49 of the Principal Act is amended -

L¿



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

(a) by omitting subsections (1)
substituting the following:

" (1) Within one month after the date of
of land under Division 1, the Minister -

and (l-AÄ) and

acqui s i tion

(a) must cause a search to be made of -
(i) the Register maintained by the Registrar-

General- under the Real, Property Act¡ and

(ii ) the Register of Natj-ve TitLe Claims, the
National Native Title Register and the
Register of Indigenous Land Use Agreements
maintained under the Native TiEl-e Act;

(b) may make other inquiries to ascertain who, in
the Minister's opinion, had an interest in the
acquired l-and at the date of the acquisition;
and

(c) must cause a
acquisition -

copy of the notice of

(i) to be served on the persons specified in
subsection (l-A) ;

(ii) to be published in a newspaper cj-rculating
in the area in which the acquired land is
situated;

(iii) if the acquired l-and is under the
provisions of the Reaf Property Act - to
be lodged with the Registrar-General; and

( iv) if the acquired land has not been brought
under that Act to be lodged with the
proper officer controlling any official
register or record of that land.

the
the

" (l-A) For the purposes of subsection (1) (c) (i) ,
following persons are to be served with a copy of
notice of acquisition:

(a) each person whose inÈerest in the land was or
may have been, in the opinion of the Minister,
divested, modified or affected by the
acquisiÈion of the land, including -
(i) the reqistered native title clairnants (if

any) in relation to any of the land; and

the registered native title body or bodies
corporate (if any) in relation to any of
the l-and;

(ii)

13



" (1AA) For the purposes of subsection (1) (c) (iv) ,

where the acquired land is a native títle right or
interest -

(a) the proper officer is the Native Title
Registrar under the Native Title Act; and

(b) the register is the Register of Native Title
Claims, the National Native Tit.le Register or
the Register of Indigenous Land Use Agreements
maintained under that Act, as the case
requires . t';

Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

(b) the represent.ative Aboriqinal/Torres
Islander body or bodies in relation to
acquired.

(b) by omitting f rom subsection Q)
(1) (c) " and substituting
(1) (c) (iii) or (iv) ";

Strait
the Land

" subsection
" subsection

(c) by omit.ting subsection (3) and substituting the
following:

" (3) The Minister must cause to be served on each
person served under subsection (1) (c) (i) a statement in
the approved form surmnarising the rights of persons whose
land has been acquired under this Act."; and

(d) by omitting subsection (5).

13. OFFERS

Section 50 of the Principal Act is amended by
omitting subsection (1) and substituting the fol-lowing:

" (1) If the Minister is of the opinion that a
person specified in section 49 (14) (a) who has been served
with a notice under section 49 fi-) (c) (i) has a claim for
compensation under this Act, the Minister musb cause to
be served on that person -

(a) unless the person is a registered native titl-e
claimant, an offer of compensation that the
Mínister considers appropriate for the
acquisition of that. person's j-nterest in the
acquired land; or

(b) an offer of resettlement,
without compensaLion.

either with or

" (14) The Minister must cause to be served on a
registered native title claimant specified in section
49 (LA) (a) (i) who has been served with a notice under

L4



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

section 49 (1-) (c) (i) a not.ice to the ef fect that, aL
time within 3 years after the date of acguisitJ_on,
claimant may lodge a claim for compensation for
acguisition of their native title rights and interests
relation to the acquired 1and.

any
the
the
in

" (18) Nothing in subsection (1) or (1A) is to be
taken to affect the power of Lhe Minister under section
894 to enter into an agreement with a registered native
titLe claimant about compensation payabLe to the claimant
if the native title claimed by the claimant is determined
to exist. ".
T4. REFERENCE TO TRTBUNAL

Section 51 of the
omittinq from paragraph
t'one montht'.

1.5. CLAIMS

Section 52 of the
omitting subsections (1)
following:

Principal Act is amended by
(b) "28 days" and substituting

Principal Act. is amended by
and Q) and substituting the

" (1) A person who, inmediately before the date of
acquisition, had an interest in acquired land (including
a registered native title claimant whose registered
native tit.le rights and interests are affected by the
acquisition) ßây, at any bime within 3 years after the
date of acquisition, lodge with the Minister a ci"airn for
compensation in the approved form.

" (2) Where a person lodges a cl-aim for compensation
under subsect,ion (1), the Minister must -

(a) if -
(i) the person is not a registered native

titLe claimant within one month after
lodgement of the claim; or

(ii) the person is a registered native title
claimant within one month after being
notified by the claimant that the native
title cl-aimed by the claimant is
determined to exist; and

(b) if the Minist.er is of the opinion that the
person has a cfaim for compensation,

cause to be served on the person an offer of compensabion
for the person's interest in the acquired land in
accordance with section 50 (1) . ".

1_5



Lands Acquisition Antendment (No. 2)

].6. TITLE DOCUMENTS

Section 53 of the Principal Act is amended by
omitting from subsection (3) "9200" and substitutinq
rr$f ,000".

1.1. ENTRY INTO POSSESSTON

Section 54 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting from subsectíon (1) "the Territory

sha1l not" and substituting "neither the
Territory nor any person for whom the land is
regui-red is to"; and

(b) by insertingr in subsection (2) (b) "or other
persont' af ter "Territory" .

18. REPEAL

Sections 57 and 58 of the Principal Act are
repealed.

1.9. COMPENSATTON FOR ACQUIRED I,ANÐ

Section 59 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting "Subject" and substitut.ing

" (1) Subject";

(b) by omittingr "or l-4"; and

(c) by adding at the end the following:

'(2) Subject tò section .894, compensation is not
payable to a registered native titLe cl-aimant unless and
until the native title claimed by the cl-aimant is
determined to exist.".

20. PREPAYMENTS

Section 62 of the Principal Act is amended by addinq
at the end the following:

" (3) This section does not apply in relation to a
registered native tj-tle claimant. ".
21". OFFERS OF RESETTLEMENT

Section 63 of the Principal Act is amended by adding
at the end the following:

" (3) Subject to section 894, where an offer of
resettlement mad.e under section 50 (L) (b) to a registered
native title claimanE is accepted, the resettlement does

t6



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

not take effect unless and until the native title claimed
by bhe claimant is determined to exist. ".
22. REPEAL AND SUBSTITUTION

Sections 65 and 66 of the
and the following substituted:

Principal Act are repealed

''65. RATES OF TNTEREST

"The rate of interest payable under section 64(l) is
the rate from time to tj-me fixed by the Minister after
consultation with the Treasurer.

''66. ASSESSMENT OF COMPENSATION

" (1) Subject to this section, in assessing
compensation under this Act, the Tribunal must have
regard to, but is not bound by, the ruLes set out in
Schedule 2.

" Q\ The Chairperson of the Tribunal may, for the
purpose of the assessment of compensation for land
comprisj-ng or invotving native tiÈ1e rights and
interests, make rules modifying the rules set out in
Schedule 2.

" (3) Where a claim is made for compensation in
respect of the acquisition of native titl-e rights and
interests, the Tribunal must have regard to, but is not
bound by, the rul-es set out in Scheduf e 2 as modif i-ed
under subsection (2) .".

23. NEW SECTION

The Principal Act is amended by inserting after
section 67 in Part VfI the following:

"674. COMPENSAT]ON PAYABIJE V'IITHOUT OBJECTION

"Subject to sect.ion 894, compensation is payable to
a person whose interest in land is acquired und.er this
Part whether or not the person lodged an objection to the
acquisition under section 34 (1) . ".
24. NOTTCES

Section 68 of the Principal Act is amended
omitting from subsection (2) (b) (i) "prescribed',
substitutinq "approved" .

by
and

25. COUNTER OFFERS

Section 70 of the Principal Act is amended by
omitting "28 days" and substituting "one month".

L7



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

26. REFERENCE TO TRIBUNAL

Section 7L of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting "28 days" and substituting I'one

month"; and

(b) by omitting f rom paragraph (a) rragree" and
substituting "in writing agrree".

27. DOCUMENTS TO BE TRANSMITTED TO TRIBUNAL

Section 12 of the Principal Act is amended by
omitt.ing paragraph (b) and substituting the following:

" (b) any offer under section 50 (1) (including any
furbher offer referred to in section 70 (b) ) ;
and. tt .

28. CLAIMS

Section 73 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "28 days" and

substituting "one month"; and

(b) by omitting from subsection (2) (a) "prescribed"
and substituting "approved" .

29. OFFERS

Section 74 of. the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting "28 d.ays" and substituting I'one

month" i

(b) by omittins
substituting

from paragraph (a) "agree" and
"in writing agree"; and

(c) by omitting from paragraph (b) "make an offer"
and substituting "by notice in wrj-tinq make an
offer".

30. REFERENCE TO TRTBUNAL

Section 75 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting "an offer" and substituting ,a

notice of offer";
(b) by omitting "28 days" and substituting "one

month"; and

(c) by omitting "the offer" and subsÈituting "the
notice".

L8



Lands Acquisition Amendment (no. 2)

3].. DOCUMENTS TO BE TRANSMTTTED TO TRIBUNAL

Section '76 of the Principal Act is
omittJ-ng from paragraph (b) "any offer" and
"any notice of offer".

32. HEADING TO DIVTSTON 3 OF PART VTII

amended by
subs ti tuting

a determination of the
appeal to the Supreme

The heading to Divisj-on 3 of Part VIII of the
Principal Act is omitted and the following substituted:

"Division 3 - Proceedings before Tribunal-,'.

33. REPEAL

Sections 77, 78 and 79 of the Principal Act are
repealed.

34. PAYMENT INTO TRIBUNAL

Section 80 of bhe Principal Act is amended by
omitting "the Tribunal, in the manner prescribed in the
rules" and subsbituting "the Tribunal".

35. TNSTRUMENTS OF ÐETERMINATION

Section 82 of the Principal Acb is amended by
omitting from subsection (l-) "28 days of the conclusion
of a hearing under section 81u and substituting "one
month after hearing a maÈter referred to it. under this
Partrr .

36. REPEAL AND SUBSTITUTTON

Section 84 of the Principal Act is repealed and. the
following substituted:

"84. APPEALS

'(1) A person aggrieved by
Tribunal under section 8l- lnay
Court.

" (2) An appeal under this Part is an appeal in the
strict sense. ".
37. NOTICE OF ÀPPEAL

Section 85 of
omitting paragraphs
following:

Principal Act is amended by
and (b) and substituting the

the
(a)

" (a) within the time;

in the form; and.(b)

L9



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

(c) accompanied by the fee, ".

38. PO}üERS OF SUPREME COURT

Section 86 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitt.ing all the words before paragraph (a)

and substituting the following:

" (1) At the hearingr of an appeal, the Supreme Court
may consider the evidence that was presented to the
Tribunal and any questj-on of law and may -"; and

(b) by omitting subsection (2).

39. REPEAL

. Section 87 of the Principal Act is repealed.

40. RULES OF COURT

Section 88 of the Principal Act is amend.ed. by
omitting from subsection (1) al-l the words after
"hearing" and substituting "of appeals under this Part".

4T. REPEAL

Part IXA of the erincipal Act is repealed.

42. REPEAL AND SUBSTITUTION

Section 89 of the Principal Act is repealed and the
following substituted:

''89. ACQUISTTTON BY AGREEMENT UNDER THTS ACT

"The provisions of this Act apply in relation to an
acguisition of land by agreement under this Act except to
the extent -

(a) otherwise provided in those provisions or by
the agreement; or

(b) of any inconsistency with the agreement.

"89A. OTHER ACQUISITIONS

" (1) Nothing in this Act prevents -
(a) the acquisition

agreementi or
by the Territory of land by

(b) the payment and acceptance under any agreement
of valuabl-e consideration in satisfaction for
compensation,

20



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

otherwise bhan under this Act where the agreement
expressly provides that this Act (other than this
section) does not or is not to apply.

" Q) Subject to subsection (3), nothing in this Act
prevents the acquisition of land by the Territory under
another law of the Territory.

" (3) This Act applies in rel-ation to the
acquisition of an inLerest in land by the Territ.ory under
another law of the Territory if -

(a) the acqui-sition consists of the renewa], rê-
grant, re-making, or extension of the term of,
a lease (in this subsection called 'the old
lease') ; and

(b) either -
(i) the term of the l-ease as renewed, re -

granted, re-made or extended (in this
subsection called 'the new lease') is
longer than the term of the old lease; or

(ii) the new lease is a perpetual l-ease. ".
43. SERVICE

Section 90 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting from subsection (3) (c) "Territory;

or" and substituting 'iTerritory; "; and

(b) by omíttinq subsection (3) (d) and substituting
the following:

" (d) by affixing a copy of
documenÈ in a prominent
which it. relates; or

that notice or other
place on the l-and to

(e) where it relates to a native title riqht or
interest as provided in the Native îitle
Act. tt .

44. REGISTRAR-GENERAL

Section 9L of the Principal Act is amended by
omitting "or 35 (3) (b) " and substituting "or 35 (2) (c)',.

45. REPEAL

Section 92 of the Principal Act is repealed.

2L



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

46. TNVESTMENT

Section 94 of the Principal Act is amended by
omitting "Chairman or Deputy Chairman" and substituting
"Chairperson of the Tribunalrr.

47. NEW SECTION

The Principal Act is amended by inserting after
section 94 the following:

'' 9 4A. DELEGATION

', (1) The Minister may, by. inst.rument, delegate to a
specified person or Co a person for the time being
holding, acting in or performing the duties of a
specified office, desj-gnation or position any of his or
her functions or powers under this Act, other than this
pov¡er of delegatj-on.

" (2\ A funct.j-on performed or a pol¡¡er exercised in
pursuance of a delegation under subsection (1) is to be
taken to have been performed or exercised by the
Minis ter.

" (3) A delegation under subsection (1) does not
prevent the Minister performing a function or exercising
a power. ".
48. REGULATTONS

Section 95 of the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by omitting from subsection (1) "rufes or"; and

(b) by omitting subsecbion (2) (a) and (b) .

49. SCHEDULE 2

Schedule 2 to the Principal Act is amended -
(a) by inserting in rule 2(a) "but not anxious"

after "wi11ing" (wherever occurring); and

(b) by inserting in rule 1l- (l-) (a) "or a native
title right or interest" after "in fee simple".

50. TRANSITIONAL ARRANGEMENTS

(1) In this section -

"amended Act" means the Principal Act as amended by
this Act;

22



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

"existing cl-aim for compensation" means a claim for
compensation under Part VTI of the former Act;

"existing proposal" means a proposal to acquire land
in respect of which a notice of proposal has
been served under section 32 (l_) (b) of the
former Act;

"former Act" means the
immediately before
sect.ion.

Principal Act as
the corunencement

in force
of this

(2) The former Act continues to appfy in reLation
to exj-st.ing proposals in respect of land in relation to
which there are no native title riqhts or interests until
the Minister, by notice in the Gazette, declares that the
former Act no longer applies in relation to Ehose
proposals.

(3) The amended Act applies in rel-ation to -
(a) existing proposals in respect of land in

relat.ion to which there are native titl-e rights
and interests; and

(b) existing proposals in respect of land in
relation to which, by virtue of a declaration
under subsection (2) , the former Act has ceased
to apply.

(4) The former Act continues to apply in relation
to existing claims for compensation in respect of which a
date for a preliminary hearinq has been fixed under
section 77 of the former Act until the Minister, by
notice in the Gazette, declares that the former Act no
longer applies in relation to those claims.

(5) The amended Act applies in relat.ion to -
(a) existing claims for compensation to which

subsection (4') d.oes not appfy; and

(b) existing claims for compensation in rel-ation t.o
which, by virtue of a decl-aration under
subsection (2) , the former Act has ceased to
apply.

(6) An application to the Lands Acquisition
Tribunal in relation to an existing cl-aim f or
compensation that. was pending irmnediately before the
application of the amended Act Eo that cl-aim is, on the
application of the amend.ed Act to that cl-aim, to be taken
to be an application to the Lands and Mining Tribunal.

23



Lands Acquisition Amendment (No. 2)

5].. REGULATIONS

(1) The Administrator may make regulations -
(a) amending this Act (other than this section),

Lhe Lands Acquisition Act or any other Act in
relation to any matter arising from, connected
with or consequential upon the enacLment of the
Native TitLe Amendment Act 1-998 of the
Commonwealth in so far as that Commonwealth Act
affects the acquisicion of l-and in the
Territory; or

(b) containing savings or transitional provisions
connected with or consequential upon the
enactment of this Act or an amendnent under
paragraph (a).

(2) Regul-ations made under subsection (1) may be
expressed to have taken effect on a day earlier than the
day on which the regulations are made, other than a day
earlier than the day on which this section commences.

(3) The Administrator may only make regulations
under subsection (1) during the 12 months commencing on
the day on whj-ch this section commences.

24




